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Diagrams of Targeted Justice

Abstract

This short ebook presents the diagrams and flyers that have been made available through 
TargetedJustice.com

Targeted is a 501(c)(3) non-profit organization committed to exposing and ending the CIA's 
illegal torture program of U.S. civilians -  through public awareness, education, and legal 
actions.  We only advocate for non-violent solutions.

We are the internet's most popular website for Targeted Individuals.  Our site contains the 
largest collection of legal and technical information for Targeted Individuals.  In the last 12 
months, we had almost 400,000 page views.

Targeted Justice has a membership that consists of Targeted Individuals and the people and 
groups that support our efforts.  We currently have more than  3000 members that have 
indicated their support for education, public awareness, and the pursuit of legal action.  We 
are the largest support group in the world for Targeted Individuals.  If you would like to add 
your name or volunteer with our team, please contact us.   Targeted Justice does not 
advocate for violence or harassment of any kind.  We never intend to threaten anyone.  We 
seek the legitimate prosecution of the government and corporate criminals that are involved.

Contact email:   TJlawsuit -at-- use.startmail.com

Introduction

mailto:TargetedJustice@protonmail.com










































Our Main Message:

1)  More than 200,000 Targeted Individuals in the U.S., are being tracked and attacked with 
High-Powered Microwave (HPM) weapons, from satellites and cell towers, 24/7.   These 
weapons are controlled from Schriever Air Force Base in Colorado.  See our pictures of 
microwave burns as proof:     https://www.targetedjustice.com/microwave-burns1.html       
This is the same weapon system, that was used on the U.S. Diplomats in Cuba, called 
"Havana Syndrome."

Many famous people are Targeted Individuals:  Ed Snowden, Julian Assange, and William 
Binney.   Also, Roseanne Barr, Van Morrison, Randy Quaid, and John McAfee (dec.).  They 
are hit with painful microwave attacks every day.

2) Most people in the world, are being precisely tracked by microwave pulses using Lockheed
GPS satellites, operated by the U.S. Space Force, Squadron 2, at Schriever Air Force Base - 
Colorado Springs.  This is the largest satellite operations facility in the world.   (No, this is not 
Russia or China.   It is funded and controlled by the CIA.) 

3)  Panel antennas on cell towers are part of a "global distributed weapon system."  The 
antennas use digital beamforming to create microwave "bullets," that can be very painful, and 
even lethal. 

4) Subliminal messages are directed through Cell Towers, at everyone, 24/7.   Schriever AFB 
is the control source.  U.S. Patent 4,877,027.  Senators, Congressmen, Judges, and even the
President, are being hit with specific subliminal messages to affect their decisions.

5)  Approximately 1/3 of the global population is "highly suggestible" and easily manipulated 
by these subliminal messages, because many are effectively in a Deep Trance, even while 
their eyes are open.  These people can be commanded to say or do, almost anything.   Many 
secondary personalities are also involved.

6)  The CIA controls and funds this illegal program, with direction from the Council on Foreign 
Relations (CFR).  The program is based on MK-Ultra mind control technology, and the FBI's 
illegal COINTELPRO. 

https://www.targetedjustice.com/microwave-burns1.html


7)  Many people can feel the satellite-tracking microwave pulse, on the top-back part of your 
head – about one pulse each second. Many people can hear the cell tower tracking 
"popcorn," by cupping your hands over your ears for 60 seconds.  

8)  This article quotes NSA data -  as of 2019, there are 200,000 Targeted Individuals in the 
United States, and more than 5.5 million worldwide.  The FBI calls these people "Targets," or 
"Non-Investigative Subjects (NIS)."
https://www.nytimes.com/2021/04/26/us/politics/fbi-fisa-surveillance.html

9) Latest Videos from Targeted Justice:
https://www.shadowcitizen.online/index.php/2021/04/14/targeted-justice-richard-lighthouse/

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=zNDswN3nnIA
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My entire collection of ebooks were deleted from Smashwords.com in January 2020, because
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kevin@smashwords.com claims he did not like my “intentions.”  He fully admits that I did not 
violate their Terms of Service, an issue of which they initially accused me.  From 2013 thru 
2019, I distributed more than 21,000 ebooks from a smashwords account.  Most of them were
free.

I am a proud government whistleblower – see my ebooks about the criminal acts of the CIA 
and FBI. Readers are advised that the CIA may be blocking or restricting access to some of 
my ebooks, especially outside the United States. Readers are further advised that digital 
tracking tags may have been placed in my ebooks.  The content of some ebooks may have 
been altered – still trying to monitor this.  If you have tried to contact me, it is possible that 
emails and phone calls are being blocked.

Readers are advised to review the website DrJudyWood.com which provides compelling 
evidence about 9-11. 
http://drJudyWood.com/articles/DEW/StarWarsBeam4.html

Note Figure 63. Dr Wood spent many years researching this and filed suit against the US 
Government, along with Dr Morgan Reynolds. Jet fuel does not burn through concrete and 
steel. The cookie-cutter holes were made by a high-powered laser that rapidly ages material -
and turned the concrete and steel into dust in seconds. Note Figure 38(a) here:
http://drJudyWood.com/articles/DEW/StarWarsBeam3.html

This laser operates at a harmonic of the blinking frequency - which causes rapid aging. 
Readers are also advised to see the movie "Unacknowledged" by Dr Steven Greer, M.D., and
to watch the youtube videos by the Honorable Paul Hellyer, former Canadian Minister of 
Defense.  He has a book titled, “The Money Mafia.”

For more than 10 years, this author has been stalked, harassed, and threatened by US 
Government agents from the CIA, FBI, and NSA - because of the content of my ebooks. My 
home has been broken into, repeatedly. In May 2014, my girlfriend was drugged and 
kidnapped from LaGuardia airport. This is not a joke. My computer, phone, and alarm system 
have been hacked, including those of my friends and family. It is truly sad and pathetic, these 
government agencies have become criminal organizations, under the Deep State. If 
something happens to me (disappearance, false criminal charges, sudden accident, etc. - my 
readers can be certain that the FBI and CIA were involved. I am not depressed, I do not own 
a gun, and I have never been suicidal – this needs to be stated because the CIA continues to 
arrange murders, and stage it as a suicide.  See my related ebooks identifying the murders of
Gary Webb, Michael Hastings, Phil Schneider, William Colby, Dr Eugene Mallove, Stan 
Meyers, Phil Haney, and others.  In my opinion, the CIA and Council on Foreign Relations 
(CFR) are behind these criminal acts; David Rockefeller was the CEO and Chairman for 
many years.

#BlinkingUniverse
#DeFundCIA
#EndTheFed
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